
CITY OF ANNISTON
JULY 18, 2016

5:30 P.M.

 INVOCATION

 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

 CALL TO ORDER

 ROLL CALL

 READING/APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF PREVIOUS MEETING

 STAFF ADDITIONS/DELETIONS TO THE AGENDA

 ADOPTION OF AGENDA

I. RECEIVE INFORMAL PUBLIC COMMENTS

Informal Public Comment – Speaker Protocol

The City of Anniston believes that any member of the general public should be afforded the opportunity
to address the City Council provided that designated rules are followed by the speaker. Any member of
the public who wishes to address the City Council and offer public comment on items within the City
Council’s jurisdiction, may do so during the Informal Public Comment period of the meeting. However,
no formal action will be taken on matters that are not part of the posted agenda. In order to ensure the
opportunity for all those desiring to speak before the Council, there is no yielding of time to another
speaker. This opportunity to address City Council may not be used to continue discussion on an agenda
item that has already been held as a public hearing. Matters under negotiation, litigation, or related to
personnel will not be discussed. If a member of the general public would like to address the City Council
during the Informal Public Comment portion of the meeting, please respectfully indicate your desire to
address the City Council when the Mayor solicits members of the general public to come forward and
speak. You will be recognized by the Mayor and asked to come forward to the podium so that you can
address the City Council in accordance with the rules outlined herein. Once the speaker has been
recognized to speak, he/she will be given three (3) minutes to address the City Council. The speaker
should not attempt to engage the City Council and/or Staff in a discussion/dialogue and the speaker
should not ask specific questions with the expectation that an immediate answer will be provided as
part of the three (3) minute time frame since that is not the intent of the Informal Public Comment
period. If the speaker poses a question or makes a request of the City, the Mayor may refer the issue or
request to the City Manager for follow up. At the conclusion of the three (3) minute time period, the
speaker will be notified that his/her time has elapsed and the next speaker will be recognized to come
forward to the podium and address the City Council. The Mayor may rule out of order any Speaker who
uses abusive or indecorous language, if the subject matter does not pertain to the City of Anniston, or
if the Speaker(s) attempts to engage the City Council Members in a discussion or dialogue on issues.
City Council shall not discuss non-agenda matters because it does not give the public adequate notice.
Accordingly, City Council shall be limited to asking factual and clarifying questions of staff, and when
appropriate, the Council may consider placing a matter on a future agenda. In addition, it is not
reasonable to expect staff to respond to any of a variety of issues on which they may or may not be
prepared to respond to on a moment’s notice, so the City Manager may respond, or direct staff to
respond at a later time.



II. RECEIVE FORMAL PUBLIC COMMENT

Formal Public Comment – City Council Agenda Protocol

The City of Anniston has identified this portion of the meeting to allow individuals an opportunity
to formally address the City Council on issues of importance. Anniston requires that individuals
who desire to formally address City Council to submit a written request form outlining the subject
matter that they intend to discuss so that they can be placed on an upcoming meeting agenda.
Members of the public desiring to be placed on the agenda to present or address matters to the City
Council must submit a formal “REQUEST TO BE PLACED ON THE CITY COUNCIL AGENDA” form
to the Office of the City Manager at least 10 days prior to the requested City Council meeting date
that you wish to speak. City Council meetings are held on the second and fourth Monday of each
month so the request must be submitted no later than 5:00 pm on the Friday which constitutes 10
days prior. The request can be done in person, regular mail, fax or email and the speaker should
obtain acknowledgement of the request from the City to demonstrate that the 10 day requirement
has been met. The request form may be obtained from the Office of the City Manager or from the
City’s website www.annistonal.gov. The request should state the name of the individual(s) desiring
to be heard and the subject matter to be presented to City Council. Requests may be referred, at the
discretion of the City Manager, to appropriate staff for mediation prior to being placed on the public
agenda. Please be advised that the mere completion of a request form does not entitle the speaker
to be added to the agenda.

III. CONDUCT PUBLIC HEARING

Speaking to a Public Hearing Item

In the interest of time and to ensure the fairness of all persons who appear before the City Council to speak

for or against a public hearing item, speakers will be limited to three (3) minutes each to address City

Council except as described herein. One speaker for the Petitioner may address the City Council for no

more than 10 minutes, unless extended by the Mayor. In an effort help the City Council and the general

public to better understand the issues, the Mayor may request that a City staff member address the City

Council from the podium. Speakers from the general public may only speak when recognized by the Mayor

during the public hearing. Speakers will be asked to come to the podium to address the City Council for

three (3) minutes and they shall state their name and resident address for the record. Speakers addressing

City Council on a public hearing item should coordinate comments in order to respect City Council’s time

constraints. Groups should select a spokesperson to present the major points that summarize their

position and opinions. Speakers are urged to be brief and non-repetitive with their comments. Comments

shall specifically address the public hearing item before the City Council, and the speaker shall maintain

appropriate tone and decorum when addressing the City Council. City Council may ask questions of the

applicant, speakers, or staff during these proceedings only for the purpose of clarifying information. The

speaker shall not direct derogatory comments to any individual, organization, or business. At the

conclusion of the three (3) minute time period, the speaker will be notified that his/her time has elapsed

and the next speaker will be recognized to come forward to the podium and address the City Council. Once

the public hearing is closed on an item, there will be no further opportunity for formal or informal public

input at a City Council meeting.

(a) To receive public comments regarding over-ruling objections to the
abatement of identified nuisances:

a. Group 2016-03 Grass and Vehicles
b. Group 2016-07 Grass and Debris

(b) To receive public comments regarding the adoption of the International
Building Code, 2015.



IV. UNFINISHED BUSINESS – None

V. CONSENT AGENDA

(a) Resolution authorizing reimbursements to city officials for expenses
incurred while traveling away from the city.

(b) Resolution over-ruling objections to the abatement of identified
nuisances. (Group 2016-03 Grass and Vehicle)

(c) Resolution over-ruling objections to the abatement of identified
nuisances. (Group 2016-07 Grass and Debris)

(d) Resolution adopting the 2016 Annual Action Plan and Budget for the City
of Anniston Community Development Block grant Program and the
Anniston/Calhoun County HOME Consortium HOME Program.

(e) Motion to award the bid in the total amount of $809,483.00 by Hale
Building Co., Inc. for the Base Bid and Additive Alternate No. 1 (Site
Improvements) for the Fire Training Center Additions and Renovations.

(f) Motion to award the bid in the total amount of $23,675.00 by EMTEK for
the demolition of substandard structures.

VI. ORDINANCES

(a) To provide for the establishment of Districts within the corporate limits
of the City of Anniston, Alabama; to regulate within such districts the use
of real property contained therein, including, the height, number of
stories, and size of buildings and other structures, the percentage of lot
that may be occupied, the size of yards and other open spaces, the density
of population and the use of buildings, structures and land; to provide
methods of administration of this ordinance and penalties for the
violation thereof. Second Reading

(b) Prohibiting use of metal detecting devices and the removal or disturbance
of unexploded ordnances and other munitions and explosives of concern
on land encompassing the former Fort McClellan. First Reading

(c) Amending Chapter 6 of the Code of Ordinances to adopt the 2015 editions
of certain technical codes and to enact certain rules and regulations
governing building permits. First Reading

VII. OTHER ADDITIONAL OR FURTHER MATTERS THAT MAY COME
BEFORE COUNCIL

COUNCIL COMMENTS

ADJOURNMENT

















RESOLUTION NO. 16-R-___

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING REIMBURSEMENTS TO CITY OFFICIALS FOR EXPENSES
INCURRED WHILE TRAVELING AWAY FROM THE CITY

BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Anniston, Alabama, that reimbursement
is made by the City of Anniston, Alabama, as follows:

a. $316.44 to Phillip Smith, Police, while attending the FBINAA Conference in Orange
Beach, AL from June 5 – 9, 2016.

b. $120.19 to Rosemary Rice, Court, while attending the 2016 Municipal Magistrate
Maintenance Seminar in Montgomery, AL on June 10, 2016.

c. $311.69 to Lee Willis, Planning, while attending the COAA Annual Conference in
Fairhope, AL from June 20 – 23, 2016.

d. $432.46 to Jean Ann Oglesby, Farmer’s Market, for supplies during month of June
and while attending training for Farmer’s Market vendors in Chattanooga, TN on
June 12, 2016.

e. $549.00 to David Ford, Museum, for reimbursement of new camera for the Museum
purchased on June 29, 2016.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this ____ day of June 2016.

CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF ANNISTON, ALABAMA

BY:
Vaughn M. Stewart II, Mayor

BY:
Jay W. Jenkins, Council Member

BY:
David E. Reddick, Council Member

BY:
Seyram Selase, Council Member

BY:
Mille Harris, Council Member

ATTEST:

____________________________
Alan B. Atkinson, City



RESOLUTION NUMBER 16-R-___

A RESOLUTION OVER-RULING OBJECTIONS TO THE ABATEMENT OF IDENTIFIED
NUISANCES

WHEREAS, Act 1995-375, Section 2, Amended by Act 2004-256 and codified as Sections 45-
8-172, et seq. of the Code of Alabama, 1975, defines public nuisances and authorizes the City
to order or otherwise accomplish the removal of such nuisances; and

WHEREAS, the City of Anniston has identified herein a specific list of such nuisances and the
appropriate remedies to abate each nuisance; and

WHEREAS, the City of Anniston has notified the property owners or other parties that may
be held responsible and has held a public hearing to consider objections to the proposed
remedy as required by law.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Anniston, Alabama
that all objections and protests to the nuisance remedies identified in Exhibit “A” attached
are hereby over-ruled and the recommended remedies are ordered to be applied to abate
the nuisances according to the procedures and processes in Section 34.3 of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Anniston, Alabama.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this the ____ day of ________________, 2016

CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ANNISTON, ALABAMA

BY: ____________________________________
Vaughn M. Stewart II, Mayor

BY: ____________________________________
Jay W. Jenkins, Council Member

BY: ____________________________________
David E. Reddick, Council Member

BY: ____________________________________
Seyram Selase, Council Member

BY: ___________________________________
Millie Harris, Council Member

ATTEST:

______________________________
Alan B. Atkinson, City Clerk



Exhibit “A”

Group 2016-03 Vehicles

Property Address PPIN
2113 Quintard (weeds and vehicle: White Chevrolet 1500 pickup tag:4HL37) 21215



RESOLUTION NUMBER 16-R-___

A RESOLUTION OVER-RULING OBJECTIONS TO THE ABATEMENT OF IDENTIFIED
NUISANCES

WHEREAS, Act 1995-375, Section 2, Amended by Act 2004-256 and codified as Sections 45-
8-172, et seq. of the Code of Alabama, 1975, defines public nuisances and authorizes the City
to order or otherwise accomplish the removal of such nuisances; and

WHEREAS, the City of Anniston has identified herein a specific list of such nuisances and the
appropriate remedies to abate each nuisance; and

WHEREAS, the City of Anniston has notified the property owners or other parties that may
be held responsible and has held a public hearing to consider objections to the proposed
remedy as required by law.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Anniston, Alabama
that all objections and protests to the nuisance remedies identified in Exhibit “A” attached
are hereby over-ruled and the recommended remedies are ordered to be applied to abate
the nuisances according to the procedures and processes in Section 34.3 of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Anniston, Alabama.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this the ____ day of ________________, 2016

CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ANNISTON, ALABAMA

BY: ____________________________________
Vaughn M. Stewart II, Mayor

BY: ____________________________________
Jay W. Jenkins, Council Member

BY: ____________________________________
David E. Reddick, Council Member

BY: ____________________________________
Seyram Selase, Council Member

BY: ___________________________________
Millie Harris, Council Member

ATTEST:

______________________________
Alan B. Atkinson, City Clerk



Exhibit “A”

2016-07 Grass and Debris

Property Address PPIN
429 Williamson Avenue 73813
430 Williamson Avenue 73748
1605 Leighton Avenue 20840
2621 Norwood Avenue 25215
1517 Cooper Short 63264
1515 Cooper Short 19002
1623 Mulberry Avenue 19960
1101 West 18th 19767
2029 Noble Street 2587
2027 Noble Street 2593
2309 Gurnee Avenue 25265
2317 Gurnee Avenue 25264
2330 McKleroy Avenue 2586
615 South Christine 66727
1710 Mulberry Avenue 19798
1016 West 19th Street 62987
1619 McCall Drive 62189
830 East 22nd Street 24866



RESOLUTION NO. 16-R-____

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE 2016 ANNUAL ACTION PLAN AND BUDGET FOR THE CITY
OF ANNISTON’S COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM AND THE

ANNISTON/CALHOUN COUNTY HOME CONSORTIUM’S HOME PROGRAM

WHEREAS, the City of Anniston is the grantee and administrative entity for the City of Anniston’s
Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) program and the Anniston/Calhoun County HOME
Consortium’s HOME program; and

WHEREAS, the City has followed all procedures prescribed by HUD regulations and met all of its legal
obligations under the CDBG and HOME Programs and HUD regulations, including the requirements of
its approved Citizen Participation Plan; and

WHEREAS, the City Council wishes to approve the Annual Action Plan for submission to HUD
including the allocation of the sum of the PY 2016 CDBG grant award of $507,227 and estimated
program income of $10,000 for a total estimated CDBG allocation of $517,227 and the sum of the PY
2016 HOME grant award of $310,469 and $30,000 estimated HOME allocation of $340,469.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Anniston, Alabama as follows:

Section 1. That the Program Year 2016 Annual Action Plan and Budget are approved and
hereby adopted in the following amounts for the period beginning October 1, 2016 and ending
September 30, 2017.

PY 2016 CDBG Budget

Administration $101,445
Estimated Program Income $ 10,000

Public Services $ 76,000
All Saints Interfaith Center $ 5,000
Boys and Girls Club $ 9,000
Kids Day Out $ 2,000
The Right Place $ 10,000
St. Michael’s Community Services $ 20,000
West Anniston Foundation $ 5,000
City of Anniston PARD YES Program $ 25,000

Clearance/Remediation (demo slum/blight) $200,000

Public Facilities $ 56,000

Acquisition/Rehab $ 70,000

Unprogrammed Funds $ 3,282

Total CDBG Budget $517,227



PY 2016 HOME Budget

Administration & Planning/Program Delivery $ 31,047
Estimated Program Income $ 30,000

CHDO Set-Aside $ 46,570

Acquisition/Rehab $107,852

New Construction/Rental $125,000

Total HOME Budget $340,469

Section 2. The City Manager, as Chief Administrative Officer of the City of Anniston,
Alabama, is authorized to apply for these CDBG and HOME funds by submission of said documents to
HUD, and to execute all other documents, forms, agreements, certifications, assurances or reports
that may be requested by HUD in relation to said Plan and to undertake all actions and steps that may
be necessary to complete the Plan.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this ____ day of _____________, 2016.

CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ANNISTON, ALABAMA

By:__________________________________
Vaughn M. Stewart, II, Mayor

By: __________________________________
Jay W. Jenkins, Council Member

By: ___________________________________
David E. Reddick, Council Member

By: ___________________________________
Seyram Selase, Council Member

By: ___________________________________
Millie Harris, Council Member

ATTEST:

________________________________
Alan B. Atkinson, City Clerk



















































































































































































ORDINANCE NO. 16-O-___ 
 

AMENDING CHAPTER 6 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES  
TO ADOPT THE 2015 EDITIONS OF CERTAIN TECHNICAL  

CODES AND TO ENACT CERTAIN RULES AND REGULATIONS  
GOVERNING BUILDING PERMITS  

 
WHEREAS, the City Council considers the safety and health of its citizens to be 

of paramount importance; 
 

WHEREAS, providing standards and requirements for the safe and sanitary 
use and occupancy of buildings and structures in the city is the primary way to 
promote that condition; 
 

WHEREAS, the adoption of current recognized professional construction, 
maintenance, and fire protection codes devised by the International Code Council is a 
crucial element of that effort; 
 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council for the City of 
Anniston, Alabama as follows: 
 
 Section 1.  The City Council hereby amends and restates Chapter 6, Article I, 
Section 6.1 of “The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” in its entirety to read 
as follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.1 – Certain technical codes adopted 
 

The following codes, and the rules and regulations set forth therein, are hereby 
adopted by reference thereto, namely: 

 
(1)(a) International Building Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three (3) 

copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Building Code, 2015 
edition, including Appendix J, as published by the International Code Council, be and 
is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, for regulating 
and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings, and 
structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other 
physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, 
and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit 
for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures as herein 
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and 
each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
Building Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred to, 
adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (1)(b) of 
this section. 



 2 

 
(b)  The following sections are hereby revised as follows: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama 
Section 105.1.1 Delete in its entirety 
Section 105.1.2  Delete in its entirety 
Section 105.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of the “The Code 
of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as 
the “Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”). 

Section 105.3.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 105.5 Replace text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 105.7 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 109.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
building permit shall be charged in accordance with Section 
6.3 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Building permit 
valuations shall be governed by Section 6.3 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109.6 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 111 Replace the text in all Section 111 subsections in entirety 
with: “Certificates of Occupancy shall be governed by Section 
6.3.9 of the Anniston Alabama Code or Ordinances.” 

Section 113 Replace the text in all Section 113 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 114.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who shall 
violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith, or 
with any of the requirements thereof, shall be subject to 
penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 115 Replace the text in all Section 115 subsections in entirety 
with: “Stop Work Orders shall be issued in accordance with 
Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 



 3 

Section 1612.3 Insert: City of Anniston 
Section 1612.3 Insert: March 16, 2016 

 
 (2)(a)  International Residential Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three 
(3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Residential Code, 2015 
edition, including Appendix E and J, as published by the International Code Council, 
be and is hereby adopted as the Residential Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, for 
regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, 
replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal, and demolition of detached, one 
and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not 
more than three stories in height with separate means of ingress and egress as herein 
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and 
each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
Residential Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred 
to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (2)(b) of 
this ordinance. 
 
 (b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section R101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama 
Section R105.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of “The Code of 
the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the 
“Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”). 

Section R105.3.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R105.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits 
shall be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R105.7 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section R108.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
building permit shall be  charged as outlined in Section 6.3 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R108.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Building permit 
valuations shall be governed by Section 6.3 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R108.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 



 4 

Section R108.6 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R110 Replace the text in all Section 110 subsections in entirety 
with: “Certificates of Occupancy shall be governed by Section 
6.3.9 of the Anniston Alabama Code or Ordinances.” 

Section R112 Replace the text in all Section 112 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R113.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who shall 
violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith, or 
with any of the requirements thereof, shall be subject to 
penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section R114 Replace the text in all Section 114 subsections in entirety 
with: “Stop Work Orders shall be issued in accordance with 
Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Chapter 3 Amend Chapter Sections per the requirements mandated by 
the Alabama Department of Economic and Community 
Affairs as adopted by the Alabama Energy and Residential 
Codes Board 

Table R301.2(1) Input the following into Table R301.2(1):  Ground Snow 
Load = 5 p.s.f.;  Wind Design Speed = 115 m.p.h.;  
Topographic Effects = No;  Special Wind Region = No;  Wind-
borne Debris Zone = No;  Seismic Design Category = B;  
Weathering = Moderate;  Frost Line Depth = N/A;  Termites 
= Yes;  Winter Design Temperature = 21°F;  Ice Barrier 
Underlayment Required = No;  Flood Hazards: (a) = March 
15, 1983, (b) = March 16, 2016, (c) = 01015C0168E, 
01015C0293E, 01015C0294E, 01015C0302E,     
01015C0303E, 01015C0304E, 01015C0306E, 
01015C0307E, 01015C0308E,       01015C0309E, 
01015C0311E, 01015C0312E, 01015C0313E, 
01015C0314E,      01015C0316E, 01015C0317E, 
01015C0318E, 01015C0319E, 01015C0381E,      
01015C0401E, 01015C0402E, 01015C0406E and 
01015C0407E;  Air Freezing Index = 83;  Mean Annual 
Temperature = 62°F 

Section R313.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Where installed, 
automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in 
accordance with Section P2904 and NFPA 13D.” 

Section R313.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Where voluntarily 
installed, installations shall comply with this Section.” 

Chapter 11 Amend Chapter Sections per the requirements mandated by 
the Alabama Department of Economic and Community 



 5 

Affairs as adopted by the Alabama Energy and Residential 
Codes Board 

Section P2603.5.1 Insert: 12 inches & 12 inches 
 
 (3)(a)  International Fire Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three (3) 
copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Fire Code, 2015 edition, 
including Appendices B, C (delete Footnotes f & g), D, E, F, G, H, I and J, as published 
by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the 
City of Anniston, Alabama, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling, and use 
of hazardous substances, materials, and devices, and from conditions hazardous to 
life or property in the occupancy of buildings, and premises as herein provided; 
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and 
all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on 
file in the office of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred to, adopted, and made 
a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, 
deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (3)(b) of this section. 
 
 (b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: City of Anniston 
Section 105.1.6 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 105.1.6.1 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 105.2.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 

permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of “The 
Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to 
herein as the “Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”).” 

Section 105.3.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “An operational permit 
shall remain in effect until reissued, renewed or revoked, or for 
such a period of time as specified in the permit.  Operational 
permits are not transferable and any change in occupancy, 
operation, tenancy or ownership shall require that a new 
permit be issued.  Expiration of construction permits shall be 
governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.”  

Section 105.3.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Construction permit 
extensions shall be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 105.3.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Occupancy prior to 
approval shall be governed by Section 6.3.9 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 105.3.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Issued operational 
permits shall be kept on the premises designated therein at all 
times and shall be readily available for inspection by the fire 
code official.  Posting of construction permits shall be 



 6 

governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 105.7 Replace the text in its entirety with: “The fire official is 
authorized to issue construction permits for work as set forth 
in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.18, as well as Section 6.3 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108 Replace the text in all Section 108 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the fire code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who violates 
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters or repairs 
items of work in violation of the approved construction 
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit 
or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
subject to penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 111 Replace the text in all Section 111 subsections in entirety 
with: “Stop Work Orders shall be issued in accordance with 
Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.”  

Section 113.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
construction permit shall be charged as outlined in Section 6.3 
of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 113.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 113.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 1103.5 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 1103.5.1 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 1103.5.2 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 1103.5.3 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 1103.5.4 Delete section in its entirety.      

 
 (c)  The geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 2015 
International Fire Code are hereby established as follows: 
 

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 Storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless permitted by the 
Chief Fire Official of the City or his designee. 

Section 5706.2.4.4 Storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks 
is prohibited unless permitted by the Chief Fire Official of the 
City or his designee. 



 7 

Section 5806.2 Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary 
containers is prohibited unless permitted by the Chief Fire 
Official of the City or his designee. 

Section 6104.2 Storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted for the 
protection of heavily populated or congested areas unless 
permitted by the Chief Fire Official of the City or his 
designee. 

 
 (4)(a)  International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three (3) 
copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 
edition, including Appendices A, B and C, as published by the International Code 
Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fuel Gas Code of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, for regulating and governing fuel gas systems and gas fired appliances as 
herein provided, providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and 
terms of said Fuel Gas Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City are hereby 
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with 
the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in subsection 
(4)(b) of this Section. 
 
 (b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama. 
Section 106.1.1 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.1.2 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of “The Code of 
the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the 
“Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”).” 

Section 106.3.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit issuance shall be 
governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits 
shall be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit extensions shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.8 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 



 8 

Section 106.6.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.6.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
fuel gas permit shall be charged in accordance with Section 
6.3 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.6.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 108.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who violates 
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters or repairs 
fuel gas items of work in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the building official, or 
of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this 
code, shall be subject to penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Stop Work Orders shall 
be issued in accordance with Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109 Replace the text in all Section 109 subsections in entirety 
with “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

 
 (5)(a)  International Plumbing Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three 
(3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 
Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Plumbing Code, 2015 
edition, including Appendices C and E, as published by the International Code Council, 
be and is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, for 
regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, 
installation, alteration, repair, location, re-location, replacement, addition to, use, or 
maintenance of plumbing systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of 
permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Plumbing Code on file in the office 
of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, 
as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and 
changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (5)(b) of this section. 
 

(b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama 
Section 106.1.1 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.1.2 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of “The Code of 



 9 

the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the 
“Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”).” 

Section 106.3.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5 Replace text in its entirety with: “Permit issuance shall be 
governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.3 Replace text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit extensions shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.8 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.6.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.6.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
plumbing permit shall be  charged as outlined in Section 6.3 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.6.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 108.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who violates 
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters or repairs 
plumbing items of work in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the building official, or 
of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this 
code, shall be subject to penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Stop Work Orders shall 
be issued in accordance with Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109 Replace the text in all Section 109 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 305.4.1 Insert: 12 inches & 12 inches 
Section 903.1 Insert: 12 inches 

 
 (6)(a)  International Mechanical Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, three 
(3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Anniston, 



 10 

Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Mechanical Code, 2015 
edition, including Appendix A, as published by the International Code Council, be and 
is hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, regulating 
and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, 
alteration, repair, location, re-location, replacement, addition to, use, or maintenance 
of mechanical systems as herein provided, providing for the issuance of permits and 
collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 
conditions and terms of said Mechanical Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of 
the City are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in 
this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, 
prescribed in subsection (6)(b) of this section. 
 
 (b) The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama. 
Section 106.1.1 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.1.2 Delete section in its entirety. 
Section 106.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of “The Code of 
the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the 
“Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”).” 

Section 106.3.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit issuance shall be 
governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.4.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits 
shall be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.4.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit extensions shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.4.8 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
mechanical permit shall be charged as outlined in Section 6.3 
of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 106.5.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 



 11 

Section 108.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who violates 
a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 
requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters or repairs 
mechanical items of work in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the building official, or 
of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this 
code, shall be subject to penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Stop Work Orders shall 
be issued in accordance with Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 109 Replace the text in all Section 109 subsections in entirety 
with “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.”   

 
 (7)(a) International Existing Building Code, 2015 edition.  A certain document, 
three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of 
Anniston, Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Existing 
Building Code, 2015 edition, including Appendix B, as published by the International 
Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Existing Building Code of the City of 
Anniston, Alabama, for regulating and governing the repair, alteration, change of 
occupancy, addition, and relocation of existing buildings, including historic buildings, 
as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and 
terms of said Existing Building Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City 
are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this 
ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in 
subsection (7)(b) of this section.  
 

(b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama. 
Section 105.1.1 Delete in its entirety. 
Section 105.1.2 Delete in its entirety. 
Section R105.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work exempt from 

permitting shall be governed by Section 6.3.1 of “The Code of 
the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the 
“Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances”).” 

Section 105.3.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Time limitations on 
permit application shall be governed by Section 6.3.2 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 105.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Expiration of permits 
shall be governed by Section 6.3.6 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 



 12 

Section 105.7 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Posting of permits shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.4 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 108.2 Replace the text in its entirety with: “A fee for each required 
building permit shall be charged as outlined in Section 6.3 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.3 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Building permit 
valuations shall be governed by Section 6.3 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Work commencing 
before permit issuance shall be governed by Section 6.3.5 of 
the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 108.6 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Permit fee refunds shall 
be governed by Section 6.3.7 of the Anniston Alabama Code of 
Ordinances.” 

Section 110 Replace the text in all Section 110 subsections in entirety 
with: “Certificates of Occupancy shall be governed by Section 
6.3.9 of the Anniston Alabama Code or Ordinances.” 

Section 112 Replace the text in all Section 112 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 113.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who shall 
violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith, or 
with any of the requirements thereof, shall be subject to 
penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 114 Replace the text in all Section 114 subsections in entirety 
with: “Stop Work Orders shall be issued in accordance with 
Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 1401.2 Insert: September 8, 1942 
   
 (8)(a)  International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 edition.  A certain 
document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City 
of Anniston, Alabama, being marked and designated as the International Property 
Maintenance Code, 2015 edition, including Appendix A, as published by the 
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance 
Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, for regulating and governing the conditions 
and maintenance of all property, buildings, and structures; by providing the 
standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions 
essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for occupation and use; 
and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use 
and the demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance 
of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on file 
in the office of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a 



 13 

part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, 
deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (8)(b) of this section. 
 

(b)  The following sections are hereby revised: 
 

Section 101.1 Insert: the City of Anniston, Alabama 
Section 103.5 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Building permit fees and 

rental inspection fees shall be charged as outlined in Section 
6.3 and Section 13.8, respectively, of “The Code of the City of 
Anniston, Alabama, 1981” (referred to herein as the “Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances”).”  

Section 106.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Any person who shall 
violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith, or 
with any of the requirements thereof, shall be subject to 
penalty as provided by Section 1.14 of the Anniston Alabama 
Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 110.1 Amend the last sentence to read: “Boarding the building up 
for future repair shall not extend beyond six (6) months, unless 
approved by the building official.” 

Section 111 Replace the text in all Section 111 subsections in entirety 
with: “Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of 
the code official in accordance with Section 6.2.8 of the 
Anniston Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 112.4 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Stop Work Orders shall 
be issued in accordance with  Section 6.3.8 of the Anniston 
Alabama Code of Ordinances.” 

Section 302.4 Insert: 12 inches 
Section 304.13.3 Insert: “Section 304.13.3 Storm Windows. Storm windows 

are designed and installed solely for the supplemental 
protection of both permanent windows and a structure’s 
interior environment from natural elements.  Storm windows 
shall not be used by themselves in lieu of permanent windows.  
Permanent windows, for use in this Section, shall be defined as 
an integrated component of an exterior wall, complete with 
trim both inside and outside, that can be either fixed into a 
closed position or openable to allow natural ventilation and 
contains glazing that allows natural light into a structure.  
Nothing in this Section shall prevent the erection of storm 
windows at the outside face of permanent windows.  If storm 
windows are installed at the outside face of permanent 
windows, their operation and clear opening sizes must match 
the operation and clear opening sizes of the permanent 
window to which attached when the permanent window is 
openable.”   

Section 304.14 Insert: March 1 & October 31 



 14 

Section 307.1 Replace the text in its entirety with: “Every exterior and 
interior flights of stairs having more than four risers shall 
have a handrail on one side of the stair and every open portion 
of a stair, landing, balcony, porch, deck ramp or other walking 
surface that is more than 30 inches above the floor or grade 
below at any point within 36 inches horizontally to the edge of 
the open side shall have guards.  Handrails shall be not less 
than 34 inches nor greater than 38 inches in height measured 
vertically above the nosing of the tread or above the finished 
floor of the landing or walking surfaces.  Guards shall not be 
less than 36 inches in height above the floor of the landing, 
balcony, porch, deck or ramp or other walking surface.”  

Section 602.3 Insert: October 1 & April 31 
Section 602.4 Insert: October 1 & April 31 
Section 603.7 Insert: “Section 603.7 Carbon Monoxide Detectors. 

Dwelling units that have fuel-fired appliances and/or an 
attached garage that has an opening that communicates with 
the dwelling unit shall have carbon monoxide detectors 
installed in accordance with Section R315 of the 2015 
International Residential Code.  Carbon monoxide detectors 
may be powered solely by battery in lieu of the requirements 
of the referenced Section, unless the unit is being rewired.  
Dwelling units that are being rewired must meet current code 
requirements regarding the installation of carbon monoxide 
detectors.” 

 
 (9)(a) The NFPA 70, National Electric Code, 2014 edition.  A certain document, 
three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of 
Anniston, Alabama, being marked and designated as the National Electric Code, 2014 
edition, including Informative Annex Chapters A, B, C, D, F G and I, as published by the 
National Fire Protection Association, be and is hereby adopted as the Electrical Code 
of the City of Anniston, Alabama, for regulating and governing the conditions and 
maintenance of all property, buildings, and structures; by providing the standards for 
supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to 
ensure that structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for occupation and use; and the 
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the 
demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of 
permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Electrical Code on file in the office 
of the City Clerk of the City are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, 
as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and 
changes, if any, prescribed in subsection (9)(b) of this section. 
 
 (b)  The following sections are hereby revised: None.   



 15 

 Section 2.  The City Council hereby amends and restates Chapter 6, Article III, 
Section 6.3 of “The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981” in its entirety to read 
as follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3 – Building permit required; schedule of fees; exceptions 
 
 (a)  Building Permit Required.  Permits are required for all non-federal 
construction, remodeling, additions and/or repair projects, including, but not limited 
to, building, plumbing, electrical and mechanical work, earthwork and grading, 
swimming pools, fences, accessory structures, building relocation, demolition of a 
building, alterations to fire protection systems and fire and water damage restoration, 
where the project cost exceeds one thousand dollars ($1,000.00), subject to the 
exceptions stated in subsection (d). 
 
 (b)   Project Cost.  The project cost for purposes of the assessment of a permit 
fee shall be the total contract amount.  The total contract amount is the amount 
charged by the contractor for the scope of work, including all labor, materials, 
subcontract, equipment, profit, overhead, and all other costs attributed to the project 
or charged by the contractor to perform the complete scope of work being permitted.  
Where contractors are providing labor-only quotes, the cost of all materials 
purchased for the project, regardless of the purchaser, shall be included in the total 
contract amount.  In the case where property owner obtains a permit for work on his 
or her own property, the total contract amount is the total cost of the work to be 
performed, including all contracted labor and services, materials, equipment and all 
other costs attributed to the project or incurred in order to perform the complete 
scope of the work to be performed.      
 

(c)  Schedule of Fees.  All fees shall be paid, at the time of filing an application 
for such permit, in accordance with the following schedule: 
 

(1)  A minimum permit fee of fifteen dollars ($15.00) plus a one dollar ($1.00) 
issuance fee, shall be paid where the project cost is greater than one thousand 
dollars ($1,000.00) but less than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00).  The 
permit fee shall increase by four dollars ($4.00) for each additional one 
thousand dollar ($1,000.00) increment in the project cost. 
 
(2)  A single comprehensive building permit covering all aspects of work to be 
undertaken may be issued to a licensed general contractor or homebuilder at 
the rate set forth above. 
 
(3)  The permit fee to move a building through or across any street or alley (to 
be approved by the building official and the city engineer), shall be calculated 
based on the estimated cost to the city arising from such move, as determined 
by the building official, except that no fee shall be less than fifty dollars 
($50.00) plus a one dollar ($1.00) issuance fee. 
 



 16 

(4)  The permit fee to demolish or wreck a building, or portion thereof, shall 
be twenty-five dollars ($25.00) plus a one dollar ($1.00) issuance fee.   
 
(d)  Exceptions.  The following permit fees shall apply without regard to 

whether the project cost exceeds one thousand dollars ($1,000.00): 
 
(1)  Electric Service Inspection.  A minimum permit fee of fifteen dollars 
($15.00) plus a one-dollar ($1.00) issuance fee shall be paid for all inspections 
performed in order to get electrical service reconnected to a structure.  The 
minimum permit fee shall be paid when the project cost is less than two 
thousand dollars ($2,000.00).  The permit fee shall increase by four dollars 
($4.00) for each additional one thousand dollar ($1,000.00) increment in the 
project cost.  Temporary electrical service and permanent electrical service 
inspections that are covered under a comprehensive building permit are 
exempt from the electrical service inspection fee. 
 
(2)  Fire Systems.  A minimum permit fee of fifteen dollars ($15.00) plus a one-
dollar ($1.00) issuance fee shall be paid to install, replace, modify, extend or 
repair a fire sprinkler system.  The minimum permit fee shall be paid when the 
project cost is less than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00).  The permit fee shall 
increase by four dollars ($4.00) for each additional one thousand dollar 
($1,000.00) increment in the project cost.  No fee shall be charged for required 
annual certification inspections when no work other than testing is being 
performed.   
 
(3)  Fire and Water Damage Restoration.  A flat fee of twenty-five dollars 
($25.00) plus a one-dollar ($1.00) issuance fee shall be paid for fire and water 
damage restoration projects on both commercial and residential properties. 

 
 (e)  Supplemental Permit Fees.  Any revisions, additions or change orders that 
increase the total contract amount shall be included within the project cost for 
purposes of assessing the applicable permit fee.  When the increase in the project cost 
results in an increase in the applicable permit fee, a supplemental permit fee shall be 
paid in the amount of the difference between the revised permit fee and the original 
permit fee.   

  
 Section 3.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.1 of 
“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.1 – Work exempt from permits 
 

The following work shall be exempt from permits: 
 

(a)  Building: retaining walls that are less than 4 feet in height measured from 
the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall unless supporting a surcharge; 



 17 

swings and other playground equipment; temporary motion picture, 
television and theatre stage sets and scenery.  
 
(b)  Electrical:   minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps, the 
connection of approved portable electrical equipment to approved 
permanently installed receptacles, and low-voltage wiring for telephone, 
computer and burglar alarm systems. 
 
(c)  Fuel Gas:  portable heating, cooking and clothes drying appliances; repair 
or replacement of parts that do not alter approval of equipment or make such 
equipment unsafe; portable fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a 
fixed piping system and are not interconnected to a power grid. 
 
(d)  Mechanical:  portable heating, ventilation and cooling units; repair or 
replacement of parts that do not alter approval of equipment or make such 
equipment unsafe; portable evaporative coolers; portable fuel-cell appliances 
that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not interconnected to 
a power grid. 
 
(e)  Plumbing: the removal and reinstallation of water closets; the simple 
stoppage of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; the simple clearing 
of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures provided that 
said repairs do not involve or require the replacement of rearrangement of 
valves, pipes or fixtures. 
 
(f)  Other: landscaping when less than one (1) acre of land is being disturbed, 
unless part of a development that is greater than one (1) acre in total area; 
prefabricated swimming pools less than 24” in depth, though the location of 
the structure must be approved. 

 
 Section 4.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.2 of 
“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.2 – Permit application; time limits 
 
 (a)  Permit applications shall be made on formed provided by the City.  All 
sections of the application must be fully completed, including any required 
subcontractor schedules.  Permit fees shall be assessed based on the project cost 
entered onto the permit application.  The City of Anniston reserves the right to 
require contracts, subcontracts, bid documents, receipts and/or other relevant data 
for the purpose of verifying project costs both prior to and after the issuance of 
permits.  
 
 (b)  Permit applications shall be deemed abandoned six (6) months after the 
date of initial submission if a permit has not been issued.   



 18 

 
 Section 5.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.3 of 
“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.3 – Plans required; plan review 
 
 (a)  No permit shall be issued until all required plans have been submitted, 
reviewed and approved.  Plan requirements, and the number of sets of full plans 
required to be submitted, shall be dictated by the details needed to fully express the 
scope of the work being proposed for permitting.  Plans must be submitted in the 
quantity specified by the city.   
 

(b)  Initial plan review comments shall be returned to the permit applicant 
and/or design professional(s) no later than five (5) work days after and not including 
the date of submittal.  If the submitted plans are found to be in conformity to all 
applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws, the plans shall be 
approved.  If the submitted plans are not found to be in conformity to all applicable 
rules, regulations, code, ordinances and/or laws, the plans shall not be approved and 
the applicant and/or design professional(s) shall be notified in writing as to the 
reason for such disapproval.  Follow-up comments for revised plans shall be returned 
to the applicant and/or design professional(s) no later than five (5) work days after 
and not including the date of submittal of the revised plans.  The City shall retain one 
(1) full set of approved plans and shall return at least one (1) full set of approved 
plans back to the permit applicant.  The set returned to the permit applicant shall be 
kept on the grounds of the permitted project at all times for use by City personnel 
during inspections, site visits, etc.   

 
(c)  The City shall be notified when any revisions are made to any approved 

plan sheets or when any additional plan sheets are added to the permitted plans, 
which shall be included in the distribution of the revised plan sheets.  Both revisions 
and additional plan sheets are subject to review and approval as set forth herein. 

   
Section 6.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.4 of 

“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.4 – Permit issuance; posting of permit 
 
 (a)  Once the work being proposed for permitting and any required plans are 
found to be in conformity with all applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances 
and/or laws, the permit shall be issued to the property owner, his or her agent or to 
a properly licensed contractor.    
 



 19 

(b)  Issuance of a permit shall not be construed as approval of any unknown 
or undisclosed violations of the provisions of any applicable rules, regulations, codes, 
ordinances and/or laws.   

 
(c)  Issuance of a permit shall not constitute a warranty or representation by 

the city, or its employees, agents and representatives, that the permitted work or 
approved plans comply with the applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances 
and/or laws.  The applicant shall be responsible for ensuring compliance of the 
permitted work and approved plans.  

 
(d)  Permit cards shall be posted in a place and position so that they are visible 

from the street on which the structure is addressed.  
 
 Section 7.  The City Council hereby recodifies Section 6.1.1 of “The Code of the 
City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall be restated, adopted and incorporated 
in its entirety within Section 6.3.5 of “The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 
1981”.  Section 6.1.1 shall be amended and restated as follows: 
 
 Sec.  6.1.1 – Reserved.    
 

Section 8.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.6 of 
“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.6 – Permit expiration and extension 
 
 (a)  If the work authorized by a permit has not begun within six (6) months 
from the date of the issuance of the permit, said permit shall expire and a new permit 
must be obtained prior to the commencement of work.   
 

(b)  If the work authorized by a permit has not been substantially completed 
within one (1) year from the date of the issuance of the permit, said permit shall 
expire and it must be renewed in order for work to continue.  The permit renewal fee 
shall be assessed on the current project cost at the time of the renewal.  The current 
project cost shall be the total contract amount of the remaining work to be completed.  
The current project cost shall reflect any change orders, additions or revisions 
subsequent to the assessment of the permit being renewed.  Renewal permit fees 
shall be paid on the current project cost in the same manner as permit fees are paid 
on the project cost in accordance with Section 6.3.1.   

 
(c)  An unexpired permit may be extended for one (1) additional year by 

application made by the permit holder prior to its expiration.  Only one permit 
extension shall be allowed.  Any additional permits required after the one (1) year 
extension period shall require reapplication as required for a new permit.  The permit 
extension fee shall also be assessed on the current project cost at the time of the 
extension.  Extension permit fees shall be paid on the current project cost at a rate of 



 20 

one-half (1/2) of the permit fees are paid on the project cost in accordance with 
Section 6.3.1. 
 

Section 9.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.7 of 
“The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety as 
follows: 
 
 Sec. 6.3.7 – Permit revocation and refunds 
 
  The City of Anniston reserves the right to suspend or revoke permits 
whenever it is discovered that the permitted work or approved plans does not comply 
with the applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws.  Full permit fee 
refunds shall be granted for permits that were issued in error, that were erroneously 
paid or collected or where no permitted work has been performed.  No permit fee 
refunds shall be issued for any projects when any work has commenced.  Notification 
of suspended or revoked permits shall be in writing to the permit applicant. 
 

Section 10.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.8 
of “The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety 
as follows: 

 
Sec. 6.3.8 – Stop Work Order 

 
(a) A Stop Work Order shall be issued when work is being performed contrary 

to work authorized by a permit, contrary to the provisions of applicable rules, 
regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws, or in an unsafe or dangerous manner.  
The Stop Work Order shall be in writing and shall be given to the permit applicant, 
the owner of the property involved, the owner’s authorized agent, or the person or 
firm performing the contrary work.  Upon issuance of the Stop Work Order, all work 
shall immediately cease.  The Stop Work Order shall state the conditions under which 
work will be permitted to resume.  Where an emergency exists, written notice shall 
not be required prior to stopping the work.   

 
(b)  It shall be unlawful for any person or firm to continue any work after 

having been served a Stop Work Order, except such work as that person is directed 
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition.  It shall be unlawful for any 
person to deface or remove a Stop Work Order placard.   

 
Section 11.  The City Council hereby adopts, enacts and codifies Section 6.3.9 

of “The Code of the City of Anniston, Alabama, 1981”, which shall read in its entirety 
as follows: 

 
Sec. 6.3.9 – Certificate of Occupancy 

 
(a)  A Certificate of Occupancy shall be issued on all new residential and 

commercial construction, additions and renovation projects once all permitted work 



 21 

has been substantially completed.  It shall be the permit holder’s responsibility to 
notify the Building Official that the work is substantially complete and the project is 
ready for final inspection.   

 
(b)  A Temporary Certificate of Occupancy may be issued, at the Building 

Official and/or Fire Marshal’s discretion, which will allow temporary occupancy and 
use for a specified period of time in order to resolve minor non-life safety issues.   

 
(c)  Issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy or a Temporary Certificate of 

Occupancy shall not be construed as approval of any unknown violations of the 
provisions of any applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws. 

 
(d)  Issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy or a Temporary Certificate of 

Occupancy shall not constitute a warranty or representation by the City, or its 
employees, agents or representatives, that the permitted work complies with any or 
all of the applicable rules, regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws.  The permit 
applicant and/or property owner shall bear responsibility for the compliance and 
suitability of the permitted work. 

 
(e)  It shall be unlawful for any building or portion thereof to be occupied 

and/or allowed to be occupied in the absence of, or in violation or conflict with, a valid 
Certificate of Occupancy or an unexpired Temporary Certificate of Occupancy.  

 
(f)  The City retains and reserves the right to suspend or revoke a Certificate 

of Occupancy of Temporary Certificate of Occupancy where the Certificate was issued 
in error or on the basis of incorrect information supplied, or where it is determined 
that the building or structure or portion thereof is in violation of any applicable rules, 
regulations, codes, ordinances and/or laws.  
 

Section 12.  All ordinances and code provisions in conflict with the terms and 
provisions of this ordinance are hereby repealed.  The following ordinances are 
hereby repealed and supplanted by the terms and provisions contained herein: 
Ordinance No. 11-O-16, Ordinance No. 11-O-17, Ordinance No. 11-O-18, Ordinance 
No. 11-O-19, Ordinance No. 11-O-20, Ordinance No. 11-O-21, Ordinance No. 11-O-22, 
Ordinance No. 11-O-23, Ordinance No. 03-O-6.  

 
Section 13.  If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this 

ordinance, or any code or provision adopted by reference herein, is held or declared 
to be illegal or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 
remaining portions of this ordinance or of the codes adopted by reference herein.   

 
Section 14.  Nothing in this ordinance or in the codes adopted herein shall be 

construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights 
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired, existing, 
under any act, ordinance, or code repealed herein. 

 



 22 

Section 15.  This ordinance shall become effective on October 1, 2016.  The City 
Clerk is hereby authorized and directed to cause a copy of this ordinance to be 
published one time in in The Anniston Star, a newspaper of general circulation 
published in the City of Anniston, Alabama.   
 

PASSED and ADOPTED this ___ day of July, 2016. 
 
 

CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF  
ANNISTON, ALABAMA 
 
_____________________________ 
Vaughn M. Stewart II, Mayor 
 
_____________________________ 
Jay W. Jenkins, Council Member 
 
_____________________________ 
David E. Reddick, Council Member 
 
____________________________ 
Seyram Selase, Council Member 
 
____________________________ 
Millie Harris, Council Member 

 
ATTEST: 
 
____________________________ 
Alan B. Atkinson, City Clerk 
 
 
 


